NSW ICAC EXHIBIT E14/2586/049/0022

Fwd: Remittance Advice

From: "Cullinane, Lomaine" <cullinal@botanybay.nsw.gov.au>

To: "Goodman, Gary" <goodmang@botanybay.nsw.gov.au>

Cc: "Thompson, Mark" <thompsom@batanybay.nsw.gov.au>

Date: Wed, 22 Oct 2014 23:13:55 +1100

Attachments: prt20141022164032442.pdf (61.56 kB); ATT00001.htm (168 bytes)

I assume this is my Superannuation payment - if so, it should be paid into the LG Super Fund,,,, not to me personally.

Regards

Lorraine Cullinane
Deputy General Manager

Begin forwarded message:

From: <council@botanybay.nsw.gov.au>

Date: 22 October 2014 4:40:34 pm AEDT
To: <cullinal@botanybay.nsw.gov.au>
Subject: Remittance Advice
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NSW ICAC EXHIBIT E14/2586/049/0022
Creditor Remittance Advice ESevoif ;}E;gw
Botany Bay

Advice Date: 22/10/2014 Telephone: (02) 93663666
Credifor Account: 1.619.04

Ms L Cullinane Altention: cullinal@botanybay.nsw.gov.au

141 Coward Street
- MASCOT NSW 2020

Date Reference Type Invoice Credit
22/10/2014 221014 INV 91,476.38
Superannuation Contribution

TRANSFER: $91,476.38

The net balance of $91,476.38 has been credited to your bank account.
If you have any query relating to the information provided, please contact Council's
Creditors Section at the number shown above.
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